EXTRAORDINARY REGISTERED NO. S-2771

THE BALOCHISTAN GAZETTE

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

NO. 101 QUETTA THURSDAY JULY 09, 2009.

BALOCHISTAN PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT

NOTIFICATION.

Dated Quetta, the 9" July, 2009.

No. PAB/Legis:V(5)/2009/1023/. The Balochistan Assembly Members
(Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Bill having been passed by the Provincial
Assembly of Balochistan on 27" June, 2009 and assented to by the Govemnor of
Balochistan, on 6™ July, 2009 is hereby published as an Act of the Provincial Assembly.

THE BALOCHISTAN ASSEMBLY MEMBERS ( SALARIES AND
ALLOWANCES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2009.ACT No.V of 2009.

(First published after having received the assent of the Governor of Balochistan in
the Balochistan Gazette (Extra — Ordinary) dated 9" July, 2009.)

Printed by the Controller,Government Printing and Stationery Department, Balochistan Quetta.

RS- 3:7D.No.lOI-70-Copics-07-2009.

Scanned with CamScanner


https://v3.camscanner.com/user/download

Preamble.

Short title, and

Commencement.

Amendment of
Section 3 of Act
II of 1975.

Amendment of
Section 4 of Act
Il of 1975.

Amendment of
Section 5 of Act
Il of 1975.

Amendment of
Section 5-B of
Act II of 1975.

Amendment of
Section 6 of Act
Il o_f 1975.

Amendment of
Section €-A of
Act I of 1975.

Amendment of
Section 6-B of
Act 11 of 1975.

2
AN
ACT.

further to amend the salaries, and emoluments of the

" Balochistan Assembly Members (Salaries and Allowances) Act,

1975 (Act-II of 1975).

WHEREAS, it is. expedient further to amend the
Balochistan Assembly Members (Salaries, and Allowances) Act-II
of 1975, in the manner hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Balochistan Assembly
Members (Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Act, 2009.

(2) . Itshall come into force at once.

2. In the Balochistan Assembly Members (Salaries and
Allowances) Act, 1975, hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in
section 3, for the words “ten thousand rupees” the words “twenty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

3. In the said Act, in section 4 for the words-“five hundred
and fifty rupees” the words “one thousand rupees” shall be

substituted.

4. In the said Act, in clause (c) of Section 5 for the words
“rupees three and fifty paisa” the words “ten rupees” shall be

substituted.

3 In the said Act, in sub section (2) of Section 5-B for the
words “fifty thousand rupees” the words “eighty thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

6. In the said Act, in Section 6, for the words “five thousand .
rupees” the words “ten thousand rupees™ shall be substituted.

-

1 A In' the said Act, in Section 6-A for the words “five
thousand rupees” the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.

8. In the said Act, in Section 6-B for the words “three
thousand rupees” the ‘words “six thousand rupees” shall be

substituted.

Scanned with CamScanner


https://v3.camscanner.com/user/download

Amendment of
Scction 7-A of
Act II of 1975.

Amendment of
Scction 7 of Act
11 of 1975.

Amendment of
Scction 7 of Act
II of 1975. -

Amendment of
Section 7 of Act
II of 1975.

Amendment of
Section 7-B of
Act II of 1975.

Amendment of
Section 7-E of
Act II of 1975.

Amendment of

Section 10 of Act

Il of 1975.

9. In the said Act, in clause (a) of Section-7 for the words
“twenty thousand rupees” the words “rupees forty thousand™ shall
be substituted.

10. In the said Act, in sub clause (ii) of clause (d) of Section-7
for the words “seven thousand rupees™ the words “fourteen
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

11.  In the said Act, in clause (f) of Section-7 for the words
“fifteen thousand rupees™ the words “fifty thousand rupees™ shall
be substituted.

12. In the said Act, in clause (g) of Section-7 for the words
“five thousand rupees” the words “twenty five thousand rupees™
shall be substituted.

13.  In the said Act, in Section 7-B for the words “five hundred
rupees” the words “one.thousand rupees™ shall be substituted.

14.  Inthe said Act, in Section 7-E for the words “five thousand
rupees” the words “ten thousand rupees™ shall be substituted.

15. ~ In‘the said Act, in proviso (ii) of Section 10 for the words
“five thousand rupees per month as POL charges” the words
“fifteen thousand rupees per month as POL. allowance with salary”™

shall be substituted.

Secretary,

Balochistan Provincial Assembly.

Scanned with CamScanner


https://v3.camscanner.com/user/download

